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HICLE RENTAL SERVICES FOR 2022 WS TECHNO

THERING OF DATA, CONDUCT OF FIELD DAYS
IN THE MUNICIPALITIES OF REGIONS X, XI &
D OF SEPTEMBER 12-NOVEMBER 18, 2022

RESOLUTION No. 19
Series of 2022

ice Research Institute advertised the call for bidding
t of Vehicle Rental Services for 2022 WS Techno
g of data, conduct of field days and related
alities of Regions X, XI & XIII for the period of
18, 2022 under PR No. 2022-08-0090 with an ABC

Tundred Forty Thousand and 00/100 Pesos (PhP

e (3) suppliers who submitted their sealed quotations
\chilles Car Rental of Brgy. Bago Gallera, Davao City,
San Francisco, Agusan del Sur, and Caraga Butuan
tive of Km. 3, Baan, Butuan City;

1

sal of the three (3) prospective bidders was shown

Item No./Qty.

AB(

Bidders Bid Amount

(7

REGION X 270

,Of

Caraga Butuan Transport
Service Cooperative

Achilles Car Rental
FRC Transport Service

P264,000.00
D0.00

No Bid
No Bid

REGION XI 270

,0

Caraga Butuan Transport
Service Cooperative

Achilles Car Rental
FRC Transport Service

P264,000.00

00.00 P246,000.00

No Bid

REGION XIII 200

,0

Caraga Butuan Transport

Service Cooperative 195,000

00.00 P200,000.00

No Bid

FRC Transport Service
Achilles Car Rental
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the members of the Bids and Awards Committee, do
rereby RESOLVED:

ocurement of Vehicle Rental Services for 2022 WS
itoring, gathering of data, conduct of field days and
the municipalities of Region X, XI & XIII for the period
lovember 18, 2022 under PR. No 2022-08-0090 to

hnsport Service Cooperative in the amount of Seven

hree Thousand Pesos and 00/100 (PhP 723,000.00),
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for being the Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bidder of the project (3

slots);

2. To RECOMMEND| for approval by the Branch Director, the foregoing
findings.

RESOLVED, this 7{» day of September 20
/

U. SEVILLE
BAC Vice Chairperson

SHAR% T. RIVAS
Membe
/E/\

DIONRILL C. NOJA
Member
\

APPROVED:
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‘ Basilisa, RTRomualdez, 8611 Agusan del Norte

Date: Segtember 98, 2022

RICKY M. SANCHEZ JR.
Chairman
CARAGA BUTUAN TRANSPORT SERY)

Baan,
Butuan City

Dear Sir/Madam,

NOTICE OF AWARD

VICE COOPERATIVE

Quality Rice. Quality Life.

We are pleased to inform you that PhilRice awarded you the procurement of the following with reference to

your quotation for PR Reference Numbe

r 2022-08-0090, .

DEPT/OFFICE

PARTICULARS

TOTAL AMOUNT

Procurement of Vehicle Rental Service

12-November 18, 2022 }

for 2022 WS |Rice

Techno Demo monitoring, gathering of data, conduct Competitiveness
of field days and related activities in th municipalities | Enhancement Fund
of Regions X, XI & Xlii for the period o September Program

Management Office
(RCEF-PMO)

PhP723,000.00

We shall send an approved Purchase F)rder for the said project at the soonest possible time.

Please acknowledge receipt of this Natice by signing the conforme portion in the space provided below and
re-fax or email back to us at mcp.olofe es@philrice.gov.ph within three (3) days from receipt hereof.

For any queries, please coordinate with the Procurement Management Unit (PMU) at telephone number

09088808976.
Thank you very much.

Very truly yours,

S

\
SIGNATURE'QVBR PRINTED NAME

S
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Phi
Telefax:

Maligaya, Science

P

lippine. R|ce Re

search Institute
ity af Munoz, Nueva Ecija

(044) 456-0650, Phqne (044) 456-0394 Loc 662

URCHASE ORDER

| CARAGA BUTUAN TRANSPORT SERVICE COOPERATIVE
Baan, Butuan City

~ | 728-250-210-000

Gentlemen: Please furnish this Office the foll

s =
bl e

| Negotiated Procurement - Small Value Procurement (Sec 53.9)

Tracking No.
RCEF-78

Page 10f2

Municipalities of Region X, XI & Xt

502010100001-001-02

~~within 17 calendar day(s) upon receipt of purchase order

Region X

No. of days: 30 days

Brgy. Panoloon. Sapad
Misamis Onental Brgy. Mal
Brgy. Kauswagan. Lagong!

Note:

"For Hire")

Traveling Expanses Loca

- Per diem, Vehicle Rental

Inclusive dates: September “2-0ctober 29, 2022

Destinations: (TechnoDemo sites in the receptive barangays, and
PIC/M/Brgy. LGUs and Municipal Agriculture Offices)
Lanao del Norte: Brgy. Pobchion & Brgy. Curvada, Kapatagan;

angoa, Balingasag; Brgy. Tabok &
ng

Misamis Occidental: Brgy. Garang & Brgy. San Apolinario,
Tangub; Brgy. Langub & Brgy. Calaran, Calamba

- Vehicle Rental w/ the provision of driver
-Franchise to operate in the above province (with LTO license

-Comprehensive Insurance (Vehicle & passengers)
-Preferrably 12-seater capacity
-Updated Registration (ORICR)

owing articles subject to the terms and conditions contained herein:

| FOB Destination

Payable n/30

264,000.00 264,000.00

502010100001-001-02

Region XI
No. of days: 30 days

Inclusive dates: Septembel

P/C/M/Brgy. LGUs and Mu

Davao del Norte: Brgy. An

Traveling Expenses - Local - Per diem, Vehicle Rental

r 14-October 31, 2022

Destinations: cT echnoDeno sites in the receptive barangays, and

nicipal Agriculture Offices)

ibongan & Brgy. Tubod, Carmen; Brgy.

Capungagan & Brgy. Gabuyan, Kapalong

Davao de Oro: Brgy. Pal
Maparat & Brgy. Gabi, Co

Brgy. San Luis & Brgy. S

Note:

-Franchise to operate in
“For Hire")

-Comprehensive Insuran:
-Preferrably 12-seater c3|

g & Brgy. Batinao, New Bataan; Brgy.
postela

Davao Orienl#l: Brgy. Bagumbayan & Brgy. Corporasyon, Lupon;

Antonio, Caraga

- Vehicle Renlal w/ the provision of driver

e above province (with LTO license

: (Vehicle & passengers)
acity

-Updated Registration (O R/CR)

lot 1

264,000.00 264,000.00

502010100001-001-02

PO Control No.: 2022-09-0043 (R)
Prepared By:Vaneza M. Dollente

Region Xill|

No. of days: 25 days

Traveling Expenses - Local - Per diem, Vehicle Rental

Inclusive dates: September 19-November 18, 2022

Destinations: (TechnoDemo sites in the receptive barangays, and

lot

195,000.00 195,000.00

Prepared Date:2022-09-09
Friday, 09 September 2022 02:09 PM
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Agusan del NonL: Brgy. Rizal & Brgy. Malpoc, Buenavista; Brgy.
Lingayao & Brgﬂi Maningalao, Las Nieves

Agusan del SurJBrgy Dacutan & Brgy. Crossing Luna,
Esperanza; Brgy. La Fortuna & Brgy. Sampaguita, Veruela; Brgy.
Wasian, Rosario

Surigao del Sur: Brgy. Comawas & Brgy. San Isidro, Bislig; Brgy.
Bigaan, Hinatuap

Note: i

- Vehicle Rental w/ the provision of driver

-Franchise to operate in the above province (with LTO license

“For Hire")

-Comprehensive Insurance (Vehicle & passengers)

-Preferrably 12-seater capagity

-Updated Registration (OR/CR)

=T Seven Hundred Tyenty Three Thousand Pesos And Zero Centavos 723,000.00
In case of failure to make the full delivery within the time specified above, a penalty of one-tenth (1/10) of one percent for every day of delay shall
be imposed. ‘
Conforme: ) Very truly yours,
\ esar Joventino MJTad
Signature oyér Printed W?bplier / Aulhdbized O‘fﬁy
q-a - aq-v
Date
Funds Available: F i 2022-09-000870
2022-09-09
723,000.00
|
PO Control No.: 2022-09-0043 (R) [ Prepared Date:2022-09-09
Prepared By:Vaneza M. Dollente [ Friday. 09 September 2022 02:09 PM

‘\
|
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p
NOTICE TO PROCEED
\
|
|
|

RICKY M. SANCHEZ JR.

Chairman \L
CARAGA BUTUAN TRANSPORT SERVICE COOPERATIVE

Baan, Butuan City i

Dear Sir/Madam, l
|

Order/Contract, notice is hereby given to CARAGA BUTUAN
TRANSPORT SERVICE COOPERATIVE to proceed with the Procuremen i i
under PO # 2022-09-0036. We will be
expecting delivery of the items indicated in the PO not later than stipulated period in the contract..

In relation thereto, you are hereby respansible for performing the services or delivering the goods under the terms
and conditions of the PO. \

Please acknowledge receipt and acceptance of this notice by signing the space provided below. Kindly return a
signed copy thru fax (09088808976), email (mcp.olofernes@philrice.gov.ph), or courier to the Philippine Rice
Research Institute, Rice Competitiveness Enhancement Fund Program Management Office.

Thank you very much. ¢

Very truly yours,

|

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT
q-4-11
RICARDO CAVCHEL JR.

|
|
|
|
!
|
|
\
|

| acknowledge receipt of this Notice on:

Name of the Representative ofthe Bljider:

Authorized Signature:

)

7
For Contract Managemgnt Use On
O issued/Served O Conforfned O Delivery Confirmed O Database Updated

L o =
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